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More than 2 million Americans marry every year, each couple determined to live together happily ever after.
Tragically, half of all first marriages fail, and subsequent attempts are even more likely to end in divorce.
David Yount knows that lasting wedlock requires more than romantic love. Success depends on a couple's
commitment and compatibility of heart and mind to survive the inevitable trials of facing life together.
Drawing on decades as a counselor and his own experience as a husband and parent, Yount puts readers on
the path to build joyful, loving, and committed relationships.

Yount offers no-nonsense advice on a wide range of issues, including financial budgeting, maintaining
health, dealing with in-laws, parenting, sharing responsibilities, establishing common values, and recovering
from divorce. He includes questions designed to stimulate reflection and discussion on key issues, such as
compromise, religious beliefs, equality in marriage, and more-some surprising. Marriage is the great
adventure into the unknown. Making a Success of Marriage is a user's guide to that adventure.
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From reader reviews:

Alejandra Dunlap:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you will have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try issue that really opposite from
that. One particular activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Making a Success of Marriage:
Planning for Happily Ever After, you could enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still wish to miss it?
What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its
called reading friends.

Michael Kelly:

That book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Making a Success of Marriage: Planning for
Happily Ever After was colourful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Making a
Success of Marriage: Planning for Happily Ever After has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until
youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on
there. Therefore not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and chill
out. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading this.

Veronica Lopez:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that question
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you know
that little person similar to reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to understand that reading
is very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge,
except your own teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update concerning something by book.
Amount types of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is Making a Success of
Marriage: Planning for Happily Ever After.

Yvonne Tetrault:

Many people said that they feel bored when they reading a book. They are directly felt the idea when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book Making a Success of Marriage: Planning for
Happily Ever After to make your reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading skill is developing
when you such as reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the idea about
book and examining especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to available a book and study it. Beside
that the guide Making a Success of Marriage: Planning for Happily Ever After can to be your brand-new
friend when you're experience alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of the time.
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