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Full 78 card tarot deck the Tarot of the Apocalypse. Created by the Polish philosopher and astrologer
Swiatoslaw Nowicki, illustrated by Robert Sobota in black and white, coloured by Magdalena Walulik. This
Polish deck of cards presents a new original approach to the tarot, based on non-orthodox, esoteric
interpretation of the main Christian symbols and ideas. The deck is a challenge. This is not just an imitation
of Rider Waite or Crowley. This is a completely new tarot concept, however strictly built-in the traditional
tarot structure. It is possibly the first deck in 4 centuries to get the distinction of being burned by Catholics as
a devilish instrument, which was widely commented in the press and Internet. The deck and the companion
book have burned in public as a tool of Satan by Tomasz Terlikowski, the chief editor of "Fronda", a big
Polish ultra-Catholic internet portal. He took an ax and chopped the deck of tarot cards and the book to
pieces. Next he burned the pieces in a stove in a place he named "Fronda Incinerator of All Things Evil". In
the oven is the place all the tools of Satan! An exceptional deck with a philosophical perspective, and a
unique interpretation of Catholic, Pagan and some Jewish symbols and ideas. Esoteric Christianity in the
Major Arcana. Polish Catholic on the pips. How do you find yourself in the times of the Apocalypse?
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From reader reviews:

Olive Griffin:

The book Apocalypse Tarot gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make
your capable far more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting stress or having big
problem with your subject. If you can make reading through a book Apocalypse Tarot to get your habit, you
can get far more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about several or all
subjects. You could know everything if you like available and read a book Apocalypse Tarot. Kinds of book
are a lot of. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this
publication?

Pedro Murray:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys this kind of aren't like that. This Apocalypse Tarot book is readable simply by you who hate the straight
word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving also
decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer associated with Apocalypse Tarot content
conveys the idea easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the
written content but it just different by means of it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Apocalypse Tarot is not
loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Scott Duran:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find publication that need
more time to be learn. Apocalypse Tarot can be your answer as it can be read by you actually who have those
short spare time problems.

Minnie Weiner:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we would like. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
had been exactly added. This guide Apocalypse Tarot was filled with regards to science. Spend your free
time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has different feel when they
reading any book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a book. In the
modern era like today, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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